
 

 

Suggested Modifications (g) to the New York Statutory Short Form 
 
Monitor: 

Unless reasonable cause exists to require otherwise, the agent shall not be 
obligated by the monitor to provide financial details or accountings more frequently than 
annually. 
 
 
Compensation of Agent: 
1. The agent shall be compensated for services in handling my financial affairs at the 
same rate as that of an executor or administrator of an estate, and may pay said 
compensation from the funds in his/her hands following the close of each calendar year 
or more frequently.  The commission shall be calculated upon the amount of money 
received by him/her as income and upon income paid out, whether such income is 
derived from the corpus of the estate or from any other source, and also a commission for 
receiving and paying out corpus of the estate paid out during the period.  The 
commissions on income and principal shall commence each year at the initial bracket.  If 
agent is an attorney and performs any legal services for me, agent shall be entitled to 
reasonable attorney's fees apart from and in addition to the compensation provided for 
herein. 
 
2. The agent(s) shall be compensated at a rate of $_____/hr. for services rendered 
pursuant to this power of attorney.  
 
 
Digital Assets:   
    My agent shall have (a) the power to access, use, and control my digital devices, 
including but not limited to, desktops, laptops, tablets, storage devices, mobile 
telephones, smartphones, and any similar digital device that currently exists or may exist 
as technology develops for the purpose of accessing, modifying, deleting, controlling, or 
transferring my digital assets, (b) the power to access, modify, delete, control, and 
transfer my digital assets, wherever located and including but not limited to, my emails 
received, email accounts, digital music, digital photographs, digital videos, software 
licenses, social network accounts, file sharing accounts, financial accounts, banking 
accounts, domain registrations, web hosting accounts, tax preparation service accounts, 
online stores, affiliate programs, other online accounts, and similar digital items which 
currently exist or may exist as technology develops, and (c) the power to obtain, access, 
modify, delete, and control my passwords and other electronic credentials associated with 
my digital devices and digital assets described above.  This authority is intended to 
constitute “lawful consent” to a service provider to divulge the contents of any 
communication under The Stored Communications Act (currently codified as 18 U.S.C. 
§§ 2701 et seq.), to the extent such lawful consent is required, and as agent acting 
hereunder shall be an authorized user for purposes of applicable computer-fraud and 
unauthorized-computer-access laws.   
 


